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A groundbreaking examination of our system of imprisonment, revealing the true causes of mass
incarceration as well as the best path to reform

The United States, home to about 5 percent of the world's population, holds nearly 25 percent of its
prisoners. How did we get to this point?

In Locked In, John F. Pfaff argues that existing accounts of the causes of mass incarceration are
fundamentally misguided. The most widely accepted explanations—the failed War on Drugs, draconian
sentencing laws, an increasing reliance on private prisons—actually tell us much less than we like to think.
Instead, Pfaff urges us to look at other factors, including a major shift in prosecutor behavior that occurred in
the mid-1990s, when prosecutors began bringing felony charges against arrestees about twice as often as
they had before.

An authoritative, clear-eyed account of the root causes of mass incarceration, Locked In ultimately forces us
to reconsider what we must to do build a more equitable and humane society.
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From reader reviews:

Henrietta Jimerson:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These
are reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person
who don't like looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Locked In: The True Causes of Mass Incarceration—and How
to Achieve Real Reform.

Elaine Jenkins:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for all of us. The book Locked In: The True Causes of Mass Incarceration—and How to
Achieve Real Reform has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take
more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book Locked In: The True Causes of Mass
Incarceration—and How to Achieve Real Reform is not only giving you more new information but also
being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your
publication. Try to make relationship with all the book Locked In: The True Causes of Mass
Incarceration—and How to Achieve Real Reform. You never feel lose out for everything if you read some
books.

Naomi Harris:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Locked In: The True Causes of Mass Incarceration—and
How to Achieve Real Reform can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book
you have factor that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing
more than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let me have Locked In: The True
Causes of Mass Incarceration—and How to Achieve Real Reform.

Tommy Worm:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching
from it. It is named of book Locked In: The True Causes of Mass Incarceration—and How to Achieve Real
Reform. You can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge
and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from
one destination for a other place.
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