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Leverage your knowledge of SQL to easily write distributed data processing applications on Hadoop using
Apache Hive

Overview

Learn something new in an Instant! A short, fast, focused guide delivering immediate results●

Learn to use SQL to write Hadoop jobs●

Add support for data to Hive in your own file formats●

Understand how the Hive query processor works to optimize common queries●

In Detail

Hadoop provides a robust framework for building distributed applications, but working directly with Hadoop
requires writing a lot of code. Adding structure to data and using a higher-level language such as SQL makes
working with Hadoop both easier and faster.

"Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to" contains a series of practical recipes that introduce the power and
flexibility of Hive. Starting with your first query, this book will provide step-by-step instructions and
behind-the-scenes explanations for how to effectively write MapReduce jobs with SQL.

This book looks at how Hive transforms SQL statements into MapReduce jobs and demonstrates how you
can extend Hive to support your own use cases. Its recipes will teach you how to leverage the scale of
Hadoop while retaining the benefits of using a structured query language.You will learn how Hive translates
a query into MapReduce jobs and explore how to structure your queries for better performance. You will
extend Hive to understand your own file formats, simplifying the loading of data into the warehouse. You
will finally add your own custom functions to Hive to support whatever use cases you may have.

"Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to" is a quick introduction for adding Hive to your data toolkit. It is
packed with high-level instructions for making Hive work as well as drawing connections to the underlying
Hadoop framework to explain how things happen.

What you will learn from this book

Start with the basics of loading data and writing your first query●

Use de-normalized data efficiently by manipulating complex data types●

Structure your data and queries to take advantage of Hive’s optimizations●

Bring your own data files to Hive and teach Hive how to understand them●

Access the specialized functions built-in to Hive to manipulate your data●

Use Hive streaming to integrate code written in any language into your queries●

Extend Hive with user-defined functions●

Approach

Filled with practical, step-by-step instructions and clear explanations for the most important and useful



tasks.This book provides quick recipes for using Hive to read data in various formats, efficiently querying
this data, and extending Hive with any custom functions you may need to insert your own logic into the data
pipeline.

Who this book is written for

This book is written for data analysts and developers who want to use their current knowledge of SQL to be
more productive with Hadoop. It assumes that readers are comfortable writing SQL queries and are familiar
with Hadoop at the level of the classic WordCount example.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Conaway:

Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We recommend
that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in words, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article author giving his/her
effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to
although doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource
information that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into new stage of
crucial imagining.

Micah Clark:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for your requirements is Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to this book consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how does the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Jennifer Buster:

Beside this kind of Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to in your phone, it could possibly give you a way
to get closer to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you will got here is
fresh from the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow small town. It is good
thing to have Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come
on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from at
this point!

Julie Bailey:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update
of news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just trying to find the Instant Apache Hive Essentials How-to when you needed it?
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