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This beguiling book asks a set of unusual and fascinating questions—why is early Chinese printing so little
acknowledged, despite anticipating Gutenberg by centuries? Why are the religious elements of all early
printing overlooked? And why did printing in China not have the immediate obvious impact it did in
Europe?
 
T. H. Barrett, a leading scholar of medieval China, brings us the answers through the intriguing story of
Empress Wu (AD 625–705) and the revolution in printing that occurred during her rule. Linking Asian and
European history with substantial new research into Chinese sources, Barrett identifies methods of
transmitting texts before printing and explains the historical context of seventh-century China. He explores
the dynastic reasons behind Empress Wu’s specific interest in printing and the motivating role of her private
religious beliefs. He also deduces from eighth- and ninth-century Chinese records an explanation for the
lesser impact of the introduction of printing in China than in Europe. As Renaissance Europe was later
astonished to learn of China’s achievement, so today’s reader will be fascinated by this engaging perspective
on the history of printing and the technological superiority of Empress Wu’s China.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Martz:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all
people in the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern
above. Every person has diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or
something that they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book The
Woman Who Discovered Printing. All type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the
internet resources or other social media.

James Sanchez:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a e-book you will get new information mainly because book is one of several ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this The Woman Who Discovered Printing, you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours guide.
Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a book.

Sandra Lowe:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
The Woman Who Discovered Printing your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each word written
in a reserve then become one form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get prior to. The
The Woman Who Discovered Printing giving you another experience more than blown away your mind but
also giving you useful details for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern
this is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a game.
Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Eddie Patten:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find
publication that need more time to be learn. The Woman Who Discovered Printing can be your answer
mainly because it can be read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.
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