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Nelson's Bible for Young Hearts-- perfect for the little hands that are carrying Bibles back and forth to
Sunday School! These bibles come in two different bindings with gender-specific cover designs. "Cadet
Blue," for guys, has a series of airplanes burnished on the cover. "Flower Power Pink" for girls has a border
of fun flowers that decorate the cover. Both Bibles contain the entire New Century Version text of the Bible
and are great gifts for children and tweens.

"The New Century Version is a trustworthy translation that makes reading the Bible engaging and
applicable. You don't just read the NCV, you experience it." - Max Lucado, Best-selling author and pastor
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From reader reviews:

Asia Haynes:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Bible for Young Hearts. Try to stumble through book Bible for Young
Hearts as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you truly feel alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book
makes you considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make
new experience and knowledge with this book.

Ismael Soliz:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Bible for Young Hearts will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think which
open or reading a book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you
in search of best book or appropriate book with you?

Denise Rutledge:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get
great deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book you have
read will be Bible for Young Hearts.

Lamar Santiago:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find e-book that need more time to be go
through. Bible for Young Hearts can be your answer given it can be read by you who have those short spare
time problems.
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