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Sequence similarity is a powerful tool for discovering biological function. Just as the ancient Greeks used
comparative anatomy to understand the human body and linguists used the Rosetta stone to decipher
Egyptian hieroglyphs, today we can use comparative sequence analysis to understand genomes. BLAST
(Basic Local Alignment Search Tool), is a sophisticated software package for rapid searching of nucleotide
and protein databases. It is one of the most important software packages used in sequence analysis and
bioinformatics. Most users of BLAST, however, seldom move beyond the program's default parameters, and
never take advantage of its full power.BLAST is the only book completely devoted to this popular suite of
tools. It offers biologists, computational biology students, and bioinformatics professionals a clear
understanding of BLAST as well as the science it supports. This book shows you how to move beyond the
default parameters, get specific answers using BLAST, and how to interpret your results. The book also
contains tutorial and reference sections covering NCBI-BLAST and WU-BLAST, background material to
help you understand the statistics behind BLAST, Perl scripts to help you prepare your data and analyze your
results, and a wealth of tips and tricks for configuring BLAST to meet your own research needs. Some of the
topics covered include:

BLAST basics and the NCBI web interface●

How to select appropriate search parameters●

BLAST programs: BLASTN, BLASTP, BLASTX, TBLASTN, TBLASTX, PHI-BLAST, and PSI BLAST●

Detailed BLAST references, including NCBI-BLAST and WU-BLAST●

Understanding biological sequences●

Sequence similarity, homology, scoring matrices, scores, and evolution●

Sequence Alignment●

Calculating BLAST statistics●

Industrial-strength BLAST, including developing applications with Perl and BLAST●

BLAST is the only comprehensive reference with detailed, accurate information on optimizing BLAST
searches for high-throughput sequence analysis. This is a book that any biologist should own.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Stein:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Blast. Try to face the book Blast as your friend. It means that
it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter
than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you considerably more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience along with
knowledge with this book.

Frank Johnson:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Blast book as basic and
daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Michael Patterson:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need
more time to be examine. Blast can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short time
problems.

Betty Bass:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Blast can be the respond to, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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