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A Field Guide to Whisky is a one-stop guide for all the information a whisky enthusiast needs. With the
whisky market booming all over the world, now is a perfect time for a comprehensive guide to this popular
brown spirit. What are the basic ingredients in all whiskies? How does it get its flavor? Which big-name
brands truly deserve their reputation? What are the current whisky trends around the world? And who was
Jack Daniel, anyway? This abundance of information is distilled(!) into 324 short entries covering basic
whisky literacy, production methods, consumption tips, trends, trivia, geographical maps and lists of
distilleries, whisky trails, bars, hotels, and festivals by an industry insider. Boasting 230 color photographs
and a beautiful package to boot, A Field Guide to Whisky will make a whisky expert out of anyone.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Froelich:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of them is this A Field
Guide to Whisky: An Expert Compendium to Take Your Passion and Knowledge to the Next Level.

Irene Delong:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love A Field Guide to Whisky: An Expert
Compendium to Take Your Passion and Knowledge to the Next Level, you can enjoy both. It is very good
combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout
people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Jose Weitzman:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet.
Every year has been exactly added. This book A Field Guide to Whisky: An Expert Compendium to Take
Your Passion and Knowledge to the Next Level was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your
knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If
you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like
right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Brian Hill:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also native
or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. By the book A Field Guide to Whisky: An Expert Compendium to Take Your Passion and
Knowledge to the Next Level we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being
creative person must want to read a book. Only choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life with this book A Field Guide to Whisky: An Expert Compendium to Take Your



Passion and Knowledge to the Next Level. You can more inviting than now.
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