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In the early 1960s, when the United States and the Soviet Union faced each other in a nuclear standoff, a
small band of engineers, designers, and intelligence officers secretly set out to do the impossible. Armed
with little more than a few ideas and drawings of the payload, they created America's first reconnaissance
satellite program - the Corona project - which for decades remained one of the nation's most closely guarded
secrets. This is the story of their extraordinary efforts, from the first desperate requests for intelligence on the
USSR, throuqh a series of heartbreaking failures, to Corona's ultimate success. This book focuses not only
on the Corona project's great technical achievements but also on the remarkable human side of the story - on
the engineers who built the satellites but could not divulge what they did even to their own families, and on
the recovery pilots who competed to see who would be the first ace. Their stories appear for the first time in
this book along with previously classified details of their recovery unit and a list of the ace pilots.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Roche:

The book The Corona Project: America's First Spy Satellites make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
pressure or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading through a book The Corona
Project: America's First Spy Satellites to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your
personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if
you like open up and read a guide The Corona Project: America's First Spy Satellites. Kinds of book are a lot
of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this book?

Shawn Proctor:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new info. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of many ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this The
Corona Project: America's First Spy Satellites, you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Jennifer David:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of
them is this The Corona Project: America's First Spy Satellites.

Rena Campbell:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day long to
reading a book. The book The Corona Project: America's First Spy Satellites it is extremely good to read.
There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. If
you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to



read this book from a smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book has high quality.
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