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Constantin von Tischendorf was a pioneer. He existed in an age when biblical studies as we know it was
being formed, when the quest for forgotten manuscripts and lost treasures was being undertaken with no less
zeal and intrigue than it is today. It was Tischendorf who found, and preserved, the oldest extant version of
the complete bible that we know of, the so-called Codex Sinaiticus, which he discovered in poor condition at
St Catherine's Monastery at the foot of Mount Sinai, in 1846.

With the discovery of the Codex Tischendorf, and others, was to take the study of biblical texts further than
ever before, through linguistic methods, and attention to the most ancient sources available. In many ways
Tischendorf was a father figure of the modern Historical Critical Method.

In this short biography, Stanley E. Porter, himself one of the most respected scholars of the New Testament
and Koine Greek currently writing, gives a portrait of Tischendorf's life and work, together with an annotated
republication of Tischendorf's influential work on the Gospels.

Published to celebrate Tischendorf's bicentenary, in 2015, this volume will be a must for those seeking to
understand how the study of biblical manuscripts began, and to understand the man who discovered the
oldest version of the bible as we know it.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Riggs:

The e-book with title Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th Century Bible Hunter contains a
lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist
new understanding the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this point.
That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring
you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea
anywhere you want.

Chris Wolf:

This Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th Century Bible Hunter is brand new way for you
who has fascination to look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this Constantine
Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th Century Bible Hunter can be the light food for you personally
because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in
the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in book
form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a publication
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the
idea! Just read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Sara Pacheco:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work
of a 19th Century Bible Hunter can give you a lot of close friends because by you considering this one book
you have point that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can
be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't
know, by knowing more than various other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let's
have Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th Century Bible Hunter.

Belinda Hamilton:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but also novel and Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th
Century Bible Hunter or perhaps others sources were given information for you. After you know how the
fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or
students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In various other case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes Constantine Tischendorf: The Life and Work of a 19th Century Bible



Hunter to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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